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IF I WANT TO TURN A MOMENT INTO A 
GOD THING, IT HAS TO START WITH... 

1.        ...SAYING ______ TO A 
__________________ THINGS. 

“The Lord said: ‘Jeremiah, I am your Creator, 
and before you were born, I chose you to 
speak for me to the nations.’ I replied, ‘I'm not a 
good speaker, Lord, and I'm too young.’ ‘Don't 
say you're too young’ the Lord answered. ‘If I 
tell you to go and speak to someone, then go! 
And when I tell you what to say, don't leave out 
a word! I promise to be with you and keep you 
safe, so don't be afraid.’”  
	 	 	 Jeremiah 1:4-8 (CEV) 

“Moses answered God, ‘But why me? What 
makes you think that I could ever go to 
Pharaoh and lead the children of Israel out of 
Egypt?’”  
	 	 	 	 Exodus 3:11 (MSG) 

“What if they don’t trust me? What if they don’t 
listen to a single word I say? They are more 
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likely to reply: ‘The Eternal has not revealed 
Himself to you.’”  
	 	 	 	 Exodus 4:1 (TVB) 

“Please, Lord, I am not a talented speaker. I 
have never been good with words. I wasn’t 
when I was younger and I haven’t gotten any 
better since You revealed Yourself to me. I 
stutter and stammer. My words get all twisted.” 		
	 	 	 	 Exodus 4:10 (TVB) 

2.       …________________ INTO A __________ 	  
          THINGS. 

“Shadrach, Meshach, and Abednego answered 
King Nebuchadnezzar, ‘Your threat means 
nothing to us. If you throw us in the fire, the 
God we serve can rescue us from your roaring 
furnace and anything else you might cook up, 
O king. But even if he doesn’t, it wouldn’t make 
a bit of difference, O king. We still wouldn’t 
serve your gods or worship the gold statue you 
set up.’”  
	 	 	 	 Daniel 3:18 (MSG) 

“In preparation for my audience with the king, 
do this: gather together all the Jews in Susa, 
and fast and pray for me. Intercede for me. For 
three days and nights, abstain from all food 
and drink. My maids and I will join you in this 
time. And after the three days, I will go in to the 
king and plead my people’s case, even though 
it means breaking the law. And if I die, then I 
die!”  
	 	 	 	 Esther 4:16 (TVB) 
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3.   ...STAYING ______________ ON THE  
        _________ ________ OF THINGS. 

“Do not become like the people who belong to 
this world. But let God completely change the 
way that you think, so that you live differently. 
Then you will understand what God wants you 
to do. You will know what is good. You will 
know what pleases God. You will know what is 
completely right.”  
	 	 	 Romans 12:12 (EASY) 

“Summing it all up, friends, I’d say you’ll do 
best by filling your minds and meditating on 
things true, noble, reputable, authentic, 
compelling, gracious—the best, not the worst; 
the beautiful, not the ugly; things to praise, not 
things to curse.”  
	 	 	 Philippians 4:8 (MSG) 

“You will keep in perfect peace all who trust in 
you, all whose thoughts are fixed on you!” 	 	  
	 	 	 	 Isaiah 26:3 (NLT) 

“Beloved, I pray that in every way you may 
succeed and prosper and be in good health 
[physically], just as [I know] your soul prospers 
[spiritually].” 
	 	 	 	  3 John 2 (AMP) 
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