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Part 3: “One Person” 
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“Do for one, what you wish you could do for 

everyone.” -Andy Stanley 
 

THE SIMPLICITY OF BEING JESUS 
STARTS WITH CHOOSING... 

 
 

1. ...ONE PERSON TO ___________ 
 
“Then Peter came to Jesus and asked, 
‘Lord, when someone won’t stop doing 
wrong to me, how many times must I forgive 
them? Seven times?’ Jesus answered, ‘I tell 
you, you must forgive them more than seven 
times. You must continue to forgive them 
even if they do wrong to you seventy-seven 
times.’”  

Matthew 18:21-22 (ERV)  
 
“Make allowance for each other’s faults, and 
forgive anyone who offends you. 
Remember, the Lord forgave you, so you 
must forgive others.” 

 Colossians 3:13 (NLT)  
 
 



 
2. 

 
“Be gentle with one another, sensitive. 
Forgive one another as quickly and 
thoroughly as God in Christ forgave you.” 

 Ephesians 4:32 (MSG) 
 
 
 

2. ...ONE PERSON TO _________ 
 
“Be like the Son of Man. He did not come to 
be served. Instead, he came to serve others. 
He came to give his life as the price for 
setting many people free.”  

Matthew 20:28 (NIRV) 
 
“God’s gifts of grace come in many forms. 
Each of you has received a gift in order to 
serve others. You should use it faithfully.”  

1 Peter 4:10 (NIRV) 
 
 
 

3. ...ONE PERSON TO _________ 
 
“You have been taught to love your neighbor 
and hate your enemy. But I tell you this: love 
your enemies. Pray for those who torment 
you and persecute you—in so doing, you 
become children of your Father in 
heaven. He, after all, loves each of us—
good and evil, kind and cruel. He causes the 
sun to rise and shine on evil and good alike. 
He causes the rain to water the fields of the 
righteous and the fields of the sinner. It is 
easy to love those who love you—even a tax 
collector can love those who love him. 



 
3. 

 
 And it is easy to greet your friends—even 
outsiders do that! But you are called to 
something higher: ‘Be perfect, as your 
Father in heaven is perfect.’”  

Matthew 5:43-48 (TVB) 
 
 
 
 
 


