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“‘You don’t have enough faith,’ Jesus told 
them. ‘I tell you the truth, if you had faith even 
as small as a mustard seed, you could say to 

this mountain, ‘Move from here to there,’ and it 
would move. Nothing would be impossible.’”  

Matthew 17:20 (NLT) 
 
THE MOUNTAINS I NEED TO MOVE WON’T 

LISTEN TO A FAITH THAT... 
 

1. ...____________ ON THE KIND OF 
________________ I ALREADY HAVE. 
 
“I ask the Father with his great glory to give 
you the power to be strong in your spirits. He 
will give you that strength through his Spirit. I 
pray that Christ will live in your hearts because 
of your faith. I pray that your life will be strong 
in love and be built on love. And I pray that you 
and all God’s holy people will have the power 
to understand the greatness of Christ’s love—
how wide, how long, how high, and how deep 
that love is.” 

 Ephesians 3:16-18 (ERV) 
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2. ...CONTINUES TO __________ THE 
____________ I ALREADY TRUST.  
 
“No one can serve two masters. If you try, you 
will wind up loving the first master and hating 
the second, or vice versa. People try to serve 
both God and money—but you can’t. You must 
choose one or the other.”  

Matthew 6:24 (TVB) 
 

3. ...WON’T CHANGE THE WAY I ALREADY 
SEE ________________.  
 
“Brothers and sisters, it doesn’t make any 
sense to say you have faith and act in a way 
that denies that faith. Mere talk never gets you 
very far, and a commitment to Jesus only in 
words will not save you. It would be like seeing 
a brother or sister without any clothes out in 
the cold and begging for food, and saying, 
‘Shalom, friend, you should get inside where 
it’s warm and eat something,’ but doing nothing 
about his needs—leaving him cold and alone 
on the street. What good would your words 
alone do? The same is true with faith. Without 
actions, faith is useless. By itself, it’s as good 
as dead.’”  

James 2:14-17 (TVB) 
 


