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“There was a man named Jabez who was 
more honorable than any of his brothers. His 
mother named him Jabez because his birth 
had been so painful. He was the one who 
prayed to the God of Israel, ‘Oh, that you 
would bless me and expand my territory! 
Please be with me in all that I do, and keep 
me from all trouble and pain!’ And God 
granted him his request.’” 

 1 Chronicles 4:9-10 (NLT) 
 
 
TO INCREASE MY TERRITORY, I NEED 
TO BE READY TO… 
 
 

1. …INCREASE MY ___________ 
 
“He was the one who prayed to the God of 
Israel, ‘Oh, that you would bless me and 
expand my territory! Please be with me in all 
that I do, and keep me from all trouble and 
pain!’”  

1 Chronicles 4:10 (NLT) 



 
2. 

 
2. …INCREASE MY ______________ 

 
 
“Just make sure you ask empowered by 
confident faith without doubting that you will 
receive. For the ambivalent person believes 
one minute and doubts the next. Being 
undecided makes you become like the rough 
seas driven and tossed by the wind. You’re 
up one minute and tossed down the next. 
When you are half-hearted and wavering, it 
leaves you unstable. Can you really expect to 
receive anything from the Lord when you’re 
in that condition?”  

James 1:6-9 (TPT) 
 
 

 
3. …INCREASE MY __________ 

 
 
“So, give me the hill country that 
the Lord promised me. You will remember 
that as scouts we found the descendants of 
Anak living there in great, walled towns. But 
if the Lord is with me, I will drive them out of 
the land, just as the Lord said.’ So, Joshua 
blessed Caleb son of Jephunneh and gave 
Hebron to him as his portion of land. Hebron 
still belongs to the descendants of Caleb son 
of Jephunneh the Kenizzite because he 
wholeheartedly followed the Lord, the God of 
Israel.”  

Joshua 14:12-14 (NLT) 
 
 


