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TO BUILD A “PROFILE” THAT 
ACTUALLY MAKES A DIFFERENCE IN 

THE WORLD… 
 

 
1. …MY SPACE HAS TO BE MY HIGHEST 

PRIORITY 

“Aspire to lead a calm and peaceful life as 
you mind your own business and earn your 
living, just as we’ve taught you. By doing this 
you will live an honorable life, influencing 
others and commanding respect of even the 
unbelievers. Then you’ll be in need of 
nothing and not dependent upon others.”  

1 Thessalonians 4:11-12 (TPT) 

“We hear that some people in your group 
refuse to work. They do nothing but busy 
themselves in other people’s lives. We 
command those people and beg them in the 
Lord Jesus Christ to work quietly and earn 
their own food.”  

2 Thessalonians 3:11-12 (NCV) 
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“Jesus told them this parable: What happens 
if a blind man leads a blind man? Won’t both 
of them fall into a pit? You can’t turn out 
better than your teacher; when you’re fully 
taught, you will resemble your teacher. 
Speaking of blindness: Why do you focus on 
the speck in your brother’s eye? Why don’t 
you see the log in your own? How can you 
say to your brother, ‘Oh, brother, let me help 
you take that little speck out of your eye,’ 
when you don’t even see the big log in your 
own eye? What a hypocrite! First, take the 
log out of your own eye. Then you’ll be able 
to see clearly enough to help your brother 
with the speck in his eye.”  

Luke 6:39-42 (TVB) 
 

 
 

2. …MY SPACE HAS TO BE MY BIGGEST 
RESPONSIBILITY 
 
“The one entrusted with five thousand gold 
coins immediately went out and traded with 
the money, and he doubled his investment. 
In the same way, the one who was entrusted 
with two thousand gold coins traded with the 
sum and likewise doubled his investment. 
But the one who had been entrusted with 
one thousand gold coins dug a hole in the 
ground and buried his master’s money. 
 
“Then the one who had been entrusted with 
one thousand gold coins came to his master 
and said, ‘Look, sir. I know that you are a 
hard man to please and you’re a shrewd and 
ruthless businessman who grows rich on the 
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backs of others. I was afraid of you, so I 
went and hid your money and buried it in the 
ground. But here it is—take it, it’s yours.’”  
 

Matthew 25:16-18, 24-25 (TPT) 
 
 

3. …MY SPACE HAS TO BE MY GREATEST 
RESOURCE 
 

“Your lives are like salt among the people. 
But if you, like salt, become bland, how can 
your ‘saltiness’ be restored? Flavorless salt 
is good for nothing and will be thrown out 
and trampled on by others.”                 

Matthew 5:13 (TPT) 

 

“It takes a grinding wheel to sharpen a 
blade, and so one person sharpens the 
character of another.”  

Proverbs 27:17 (TPT) 
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